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Note: You may access information from this open meeting and prior meetings at: https://www.utc.wa.gov/open-meetings.     

Note: To request availability of the documents in alternative formats, please call (360) 664-1234. 
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Open Meeting Agenda 

09/25/2025 
9:30 A.M. 

 

NOTE: In order to listen or participate in the open meeting you may attend by calling 
253-215-8782 and entering conference ID 822 2298 0674. You will be prompted to 
enter a passcode for this meeting, that passcode is 570712.REMINDER: In order to 
mute or un-mute your phone, you must use the keypad by pressing *6. You may also 
visit the Commission’s website for the link to the zoom meeting. 

NOTE: Due to the number of items on the discussion portion of the agenda, the open 
meeting may continue past 12:00pm. 

 

A. UTILITIES 

Item Docket 
Company 
Description 

1. UE-250132 Avista Corporation 

Petition for an order authorizing deferred accounting treatment for the 
costs of tariffs imposed on natural gas imported from Canada. 

Petition for Accounting Order 

Staff Contact: Chris McGuire  +1 (360) 664-1310 
chris.mcguire@utc.wa.gov 

2. UE-250135 Puget Sound Energy 

Petition for an order authorizing deferred accounting treatment for the 
costs of tariffs imposed on natural gas imported from Canada. 

Petition for Accounting Order 

Staff Contact: Chris McGuire  +1 (360) 664-1310 
chris.mcguire@utc.wa.gov 

https://www.utc.wa.gov/open-meetings
http://www.utc.wa.gov/
mailto:info@utc.wa.gov
mailto:chris.mcguire@utc.wa.gov
mailto:chris.mcguire@utc.wa.gov
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3. UE-250318 Puget Sound Energy 

Annual Power Cost Adjustment mechanism filing, requesting approval for 
revisions to Tariff Schedules 95 and Schedule 139 resulting in a net 
power cost revenue requirement increase of $26.8 million, or 0.8 percent, 
to be recovered over 15 months effective October 1, 2025. A typical 
residential ratepayer using 800 kWh would see a $0.72, or 0.5 percent, 
increase in their bill each month. 

Petition 

Staff Contact: Kody McConnell  +1 (360) 664-1216 
kody.mcconnell@utc.wa.gov 

4. UE-250695 PacifiCorp 

Revises Tariff WN U-76, the purpose of this filing is to establish Schedule 
138 – Net Billing Service, which PacifiCorp proposes as the successor to 
Schedule 135 – Net Metering Service. The filing also includes proposed 
changes to Schedule 135 to close it to new applications and ensure an 
orderly transition from Net Metering to Net Billing. These changes include 
establishing a deadline for new Net Metering applications and introducing 
the Equitable Access Credit, which is designed to support continued 
access to distributed generation benefits for income-qualified customers. 
The Company estimates that its Net Billing service customers will save 
$1,280 annually. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Dave Gomez  +1 (360) 664-1207 
dave.gomez@utc.wa.gov 

5. UG-250151 Cascade Natural Gas Company 

Petition for an order authorizing deferred accounting treatment for the 
costs of tariffs imposed on natural gas imported from Canada. 

Petition for Accounting Order 

Staff Contact: Chris McGuire  +1 (360) 664-1310 
chris.mcguire@utc.wa.gov 

6. UG-250429 Northwest Natural Gas Company d/b/a NW Natural 

Conservation Potential Assessment for the 2026-2027 biennium in 
compliance with RCW 80.28.380. 

Staff Investigation 

Staff Contact: Joshua Dennis  +1 (360) 664-1315 
joshua.dennis@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:kody.mcconnell@utc.wa.gov
mailto:dave.gomez@utc.wa.gov
mailto:chris.mcguire@utc.wa.gov
mailto:joshua.dennis@utc.wa.gov
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7. UW-250570 Basin Water Sources, Inc. 

Tariff filing for a surcharge of $7.59 per month. The purpose of the 
surcharge is to reimburse the Company for expenses incurred for an 
engineering assessment of the water system. The assessment cost will 
not exceed $64,500 and it is proposed to be recovered over two years. 
The assessment will result in a 20-year capital plan for Basin Water 
Sources, Inc. and is meant to help prioritize the replacement of the 
ageing water system as it is 60 years old. The Company serves about 
397 connections in Grant County. The Company’s last general rate 
increase was effective January 1, 2021, for $8,305 (8.5 percent) of 
additional annual revenue.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tiffany Van Meter  +1 (360) 664-1246 
tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov 

B. TRANSPORTATION 

Item Docket 
Company 
Description 

1. TG-250532 Waste Management of Washington, Inc.   

General rate increase request for Waste Management of Washington, 
Inc. d/b/a Waste Management of Kennewick that generates 
approximately $1,179,000 million (39 percent) additional annual revenue 
for the collection of garbage services. Commission Staff and the 
Company have agreed to a lower additional annual revenue amount of 
approximately $1,133,091 (37 percent) resulting in lower revised rates. 
The Company provides regulated solid waste collection service to 
approximately 6,833 residential and commercial customers in Benton 
County. The Company’s last general rate increase became effective on 
December 1, 2010. The Company is also requesting a petition for 
exemption of WAC 480-07-520(4) for submitting work papers filing 
requirements. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tonia Bailey  +1 (360) 664-1244 
tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov 

C. OTHER 

D. RECESSED 

E. CONSENT 

Item Docket 
Company 
Description 

mailto:tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov
mailto:tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov
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1. TG-250385 Kent-Meridian Disposal Company 

Less than Statutory Notice request from Kent-Meridian Disposal for Tariff 
Revisions and request to retain up to 50 percent of the revenue received 
for the sale or recyclable commodities in accordance with the Revenue 
Sharing Plan with King County, and a $0.63 increase (credit increase 
from debit $0.05 to credit $0.58) per month for residential recycling 
customers and $0.23 increase (credit increase from $0.00 to $0.23) per 
yard/month for multi-family recycling customers. The Company serves 
approximately 22,000 residential and 370 multi-family recycling 
customers in King County. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Kelsey Hanson  +1 (360) 664-1250 
kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov 

2. TG-250393 RABANCO LTD.  

Less than Statutory request by Rabanco, Ltd d/b/a Eastside Disposal 
Tariff Revisions and request to retain up to 50 percent of the revenue 
received for the sale or recyclable commodities in accordance with the 
Revenue Sharing Plan with King County, and a $0.67 increase (credit 
decrease from a credit of $0.03 to charge of $0.64) per month for 
residential recycling customers and $0.35 increase (credit decrease from 
$0.03 to a charge of $0.32) per yard for multi-family recycling customers. 
The Company serves approximately 8,280 residential and 2,200 multi-
family recycling customers in King County.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Benjamin Sharbono  +1 (360) 664-1242 
benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov 

3. UG-250411 Cascade Natural Gas Corporation  

Conservation Potential Assessment for the 2026-2027 biennium in 
compliance with RCW 80.28.380. 

Staff Investigation 

Staff Contact: Sofya Atitsogbe  +1 (360) 664-1255 
sofya.atitsogbe@utc.wa.gov 

4. UG-250416 Puget Sound Energy 

Conservation Potential Assessment for the 2026-2027 biennium in 
compliance with RCW 80.28.380. 

Staff Investigation 

Staff Contact: Wesley Franks  +1 (360) 664-1324 
wesley.franks@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov
mailto:benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov
mailto:sofya.atitsogbe@utc.wa.gov
mailto:wesley.franks@utc.wa.gov
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5. UG-250430 Avista Corporation d/b/a Avista Utilities 

Conservation Potential Assessment for the 2026-2027 biennium in 
compliance with RCW 80.28.380. 

Staff Investigation 

Staff Contact: Sofya Atitsogbe  +1 (360) 664-1255 
sofya.atitsogbe@utc.wa.gov 

6. TG-250433 RABANCO LTD. 

Less than Statutory Notice request from SeaTac Disposal for Tariff 
Revisions and request to retain up to 50 percent of the revenue received 
for the sale or recyclable commodities in accordance with the Revenue 
Sharing Plan with King County, and a $0.63 decrease (credit increase 
from $0.03 to $0.66) per month for residential recycling customers and 
$0.38 decrease (from a debit of $0.01 to a credit of $0.39) per yard for 
multi-family recycling customers. The Company serves approximately 
5,000 residential and 600 multi-family recycling customers in King 
County.   

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tiffany Van Meter  +1 (360) 664-1246 
tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov 

7. TG-250581 Rubatino Refuse Removal LLC 

Less than Statutory Notice request for notice to customers for revisions 
to Tariff No. 9.1 to increase rates due to the increased B & O tax from 
1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. The Company 
provides service to approximately 21,600 customers in Snohomish 
County.  The Company's last general rate case became effective April 1, 
2023. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tiffany Van Meter  +1 (360) 664-1246 
tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:sofya.atitsogbe@utc.wa.gov
mailto:tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov
mailto:tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov
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8. TG-250587 Sanitary Service Company, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for notice to customers of Tariff No. 
10 to increase rates due to the increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 
2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. The increase provides an 
additional annual revenue of approximately $89,000 (0.3 percent). Also, 
rate increase for item 53 to reflect Lummi Ferry Fees effective August 23, 
2025, per Whatcom County Executive Order 2025-03. Third, Tariff 
Revisions on Item 230, drop box disposal fees. On June 1, 2025, drop 
box disposal fees set by Recycling & Disposal Services, Inc. increased 
passenger tires from $10.30 to $12.36 each. Lastly, Tariff Revisions on 
Item 230, drop box disposal fees. Republic Services added 4th day rates 
at $50 per day for 20’ and 48’ containers. The Company provides 
regulated solid waste collection service to approximately 49,000 
residential customers and approximately 5,000 drop box customers in 
Whatcom County. Company’s last general rate increase became 
effective on May 22, 2025. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Kelsey Hanson  +1 (360) 664-1250 
kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov 

9. TG-250620 Bainbridge Disposal, Inc 

Less than Statutory notice request for Tariff Revisions for a $1.92 
decrease (debit decrease from $2.30 to $0.38) per month for residential 
recycling customers and $1.70 increase (debit increase from $0.04 to 
$1.74) per month for multi-family recycling customers. The Company 
serves approximately 7000 residential and 1670 multi-family recycling 
customers on Bainbridge Island, in Kitsap County. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tonia Bailey  +1 (360) 664-1244 
tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov 

10. TG-250622 Harold LeMay Enterprises, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Harold LeMay Enterprises, Inc. 
d/b/a Pacific Disposal, Butlers Cove Refuse Service, and Rural Garbage 
Service, notice to customers of Tariff No. 10 to increase rates due to the 
increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 
2025. The Company provides solid waste service to approximately 
66,000 customers. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on September 1, 2024. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tonia Bailey  +1 (360) 664-1244 
tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov
mailto:tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov
mailto:tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov
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11. TG-250625 Murrey's Disposal Company, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Murrey's Disposal Co, notice to 
customers of Tariff No. 3 to increase rates due to the increased B&O tax 
from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. Also, 
requesting Tariff revisions that would generate approximately $5,500 (2.8 
percent) additional annual revenue to recover the increased cost of 
disposal fees set by the Trilogy MedWaste, Inc. On October 1, 2025, 
disposal fees will increase from $0.45 per pound to $0.55 per pound for 
hauling regulated medical waste. The Company provides medical waste 
service to approximately 350 customers. The Company's last general 
rate case became effective on April 1, 2023.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Benjamin Sharbono  +1 (360) 664-1242 
benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov 

12. TG-250626 Waste Connections of Washington, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Waste Connections of Washington 
Inc., notice to customers of Tariff No. 4 to increase rates due to the 
increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 
2025. The Company provides solid waste service to approximately 
81,000 customers. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on September 1, 2024.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Benjamin Sharbono  +1 (360) 664-1242 
benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov 

13. TG-250627 Harold LeMay Enterprises, Inc.      

Less than Statutory Notice request for Harold LeMay Enterprises Inc. dba 
Peirce County Refuse, notice to customers of Tariff No. 12 to increase 
rates due to the increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent 
effective October 1, 2025. The Company provides solid waste service to 
approximately 63,000 customers in Peirce County and approximately 
10,000 customers in JBLM. The Company's last general rate case 
became effective on January 1, 2025.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Jaclynn Simmons  +1 (360) 664-1253 
jaclynn.simmons@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov
mailto:benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov
mailto:jaclynn.simmons@utc.wa.gov
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14. TG-250628 Waste Connections of Oregon, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Waste Connections of Oregon, 
Inc. d/b/a Sanitary Disposal, notice to customers of Tariff No. 5 to 
increase rates due to the increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 
percent effective October 1, 2025. The Company provides solid waste 
service to approximately 211 customers. The Company's last general 
rate case became effective on April 1, 2024. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tonia Bailey  +1 (360) 664-1244 
tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov 

15. TG-250629 Yakima Waste Systems, Inc.    

Less than Statutory Notice request for Yakima Waste System, Inc., 
notice to customers of Tariff No. 13 to increase rates due to the 
increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 
2025. The Company serves approximately 17,079 garbage customers in 
Yakima County. The Company's last general rate case became effective 
on October 1, 2024.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Kelsey Hanson  +1 (360) 664-1250 
kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov 

16. TG-250630 Murrey's Disposal Company, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Murrey's Disposal Co, notice to 
customers of Tariff No. 29 to increase rates due to the increased B&O 
tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. The 
Company provides garbage, yard waste and recycling, roll off, and multi-
family residential and commercial service to approximately 141,300 
customers affected by this change. The Company's last general rate 
case became effective on June 1, 2025.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Rachel Stark  +1 (360) 664-1272 
rachel.stark@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov
mailto:kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov
mailto:rachel.stark@utc.wa.gov
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17. TG-250631 Island Disposal, Inc.    

Less than Statutory Notice request for Island Disposal, Inc. notice to 
customers to increase rates due to the increased B&O tax from 1.75 
percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. The Company 
provides residential and commercial garbage and roll off service to 
approximately 13,800 customers. The Company's last general rate case 
became effective on May 1, 2024.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Rachel Stark  +1 (360) 664-1272 
rachel.stark@utc.wa.gov 

18. TG-250632 Mason County Garbage Co., Inc.   

Less than Statutory Notice request for Mason County Garbage Co., 
notice to customers of Tariff No. 15 to increase rates due to the 
increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 
2025. The Company provides medical waste service to approximately 
17,000 customers. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on September 1, 2024.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Scott Sevall  3606641245 
scott.sevall@utc.wa.gov 

19. TG-250633 Peninsula Sanitation Service, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Peninsula Sanitation Service, Inc., 
notice to customers of Tariff No. 11 to increase rates due to the 
increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 
2025. The Company provides medical waste service to approximately 
7,160 customers. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on September 1, 2023.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Scott Sevall  (360) 664-1234 
scott.sevall@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:rachel.stark@utc.wa.gov
mailto:scott.sevall@utc.wa.gov
mailto:scott.sevall@utc.wa.gov
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20. TG-250634 Harold LeMay Enterprises, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Harold LeMay Enterprises, Inc. 
d/b/a Harbor Disposal and Eastern Gray's Harbor Disposal Tariff No. 15 
notice to customers to increase rates due to the increased B&O tax from 
1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. The Company 
provides residential and commercial garbage, recycling and roll off 
service to approximately 8,250 customers. The Company's last general 
rate case became effective on August 1, 2025.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Rachel Stark  +1 (360) 664-1272 
rachel.stark@utc.wa.gov 

21. TG-250637 American Disposal Company, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for American Disposal Co., Inc. d/b/a 
Vashon Disposal, notice to customers of Tariff No. 2 to increase rates 
due to the increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective 
October 1, 2025. The Company provides solid waste service to 
approximately 2740 customers. The Company's last general rate case 
became effective on May 1, 2023. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tonia Bailey  +1 (360) 664-1244 
tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov 

22. TG-250639 Murrey's Disposal Company, Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Murrey's Disposal Company, Inc., 
d/b/a Olympic Disposal notice to customers of Tariff No. 25 to increase 
rates due to the increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 
percent effective October 1, 2025. The Company serves approximately 
11,000 residential; 1,100 commercial; 89 roll-off; and 5,250 residential 
recycling customers in Clallam County and 4,500 residential; 800 
commercial; 28 roll-off; and 790 residential recycling customers in 
Jefferson County. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on December 1, 2024.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Kelsey Hanson  +1 (360) 664-1250 
kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:rachel.stark@utc.wa.gov
mailto:tonia.bailey@utc.wa.gov
mailto:kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov
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23. TG-250642 Waste Control, Inc 

Less than Statutory Notice request for Waste Control, Inc., notice to 
customers of Tariff No. 20 to increase rates due to the increased B&O 
tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. The 
Company provides solid waste service to approximately 13,000 
customers. The Company's last general rate case became effective on 
March 1, 2023.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Jaclynn Simmons  +1 (360) 664-1253 
jaclynn.simmons@utc.wa.gov 

24. TG-250643 Empire Disposal Inc. 

Less than Statutory Notice request for notice to customers for Tariff 
Revisions to increase rates due to the increased B&O tax from 1.75 
percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. The Company 
provides service to approximately 7,000 customers in Spokane and 
Whitman Counties. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on May 1, 2023.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tiffany Van Meter  +1 (360) 664-1246 
tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov 

25. TG-250646 Columbia River Disposal, Inc.   

Less than Statutory Notice request for Columbia River Disposal, Inc. G-
48 notice to customers of Tariff No. 8 to increase rates due to the 
increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 
2025. The Company serves approximately 2,665 garbage customers in 
Skamania County. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on April 1, 2018.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Kelsey Hanson  +1 (360) 664-1250 
kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:jaclynn.simmons@utc.wa.gov
mailto:tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov
mailto:kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov
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26. TG-250667 Columbia River Disposal, Inc.   

Less than Statutory Notice request for Columbia River Disposal, Inc. G-
51 notice to customers of Tariff No. 13 to increase rates due to the 
increased B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 
2025. The Company serves approximately 217 garbage customers in 
Skamania County. The Company's last general rate case became 
effective on April 1, 2018.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Benjamin Sharbono  +1 (360) 664-1242 
benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov 

27. TG-250679 Pullman Disposal Service, Inc 

Less than Statutory Notice request for customer notice and request Tariff 
Revisions for a $0.47 increase (debit increase from $0.72 to debit of 
$1.19) per month for residential recycling customers and $0.14 increase 
(debit increases from $0.40 to debit of $0.49) per month for multi-family 
recycling customers. The Company serves 6,000 customers in Whitman 
County.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Benjamin Sharbono  +1 (360) 664-1242 
benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov 

28. TG-250691 Waste Management of Washington, Inc.   

Less than Statutory notice request for Waste Management of Ellensburg, 
Tariff 12 Revisions that would generate approximately $123,000 (6 
percent) additional annual revenue to recover the increased cost of 
disposal fees set by the Kittitas County Board of Commissioners. On 
October 1, 2025, disposal fees will increase from $158 per ton to $179 
per ton at the Kittitas County Solid Waste System. The Company serves 
approximately 4,500 customers in Kittitas County. The Company’s last 
general rate increase became effective on November 1, 2024.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Kelsey Hanson  +1 (360) 664-1250 
kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov
mailto:benjamin.sharbono@utc.wa.gov
mailto:kelsey.hanson@utc.wa.gov


Page 13 

 

29. TG-250702 Harold LeMay Enterprises, Inc.            

City Sanitary Co.; Joe's Refuse Service; White Pass Garbage Co., Less 
than Statutory Notice request for notice to the Commission 
and customers for Tariff Revisions to increase rates due to the increased 
B&O tax from 1.75 percent to 2.10 percent effective October 1, 2025. 
The Company serves approximately 20,000 customers in Lewis 
County.  The Company's last general rate case became effective May 1, 
2024.  

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Tiffany Van Meter  +1 (360) 664-1246 
tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov 

F. NO ACTION 

Item Docket 
Re/Filed 
Effective 

Company 
Description 

1. TG-250597 8/6/2025 

10/1/2025 
West Waste & Recycling, Inc. 

General rate increase request that, as originally filed, 
would have generated approximately $644,000 (41 
percent) additional annual revenue for the collection of 
garbage services. Commission Staff and the Company 
have agreed to a lower additional annual revenue 
amount of approximately $518,000 (32 percent) resulting 
in lower revised rates. The Company provides regulated 
solid waste collection service to approximately 638 
residential, 1,640 commercial, and 110 drop box 
customers in Clallam and Jefferson County. The 
Company’s last general rate increase became effective 
on April 1, 2019. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Scott Sevall  3606641245 
scott.sevall@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:tiffany.vanmeter@utc.wa.gov
mailto:scott.sevall@utc.wa.gov
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2. UG-250618 8/15/2025 

10/1/2025 
Cascade Natural Gas Corporation 

Revises Tariff WN U-3, Rule 20, Cascade Arrearage 
Relief Energy Savings (CARES) Program, modifying 
how the company bills a customer who is participating in 
the CARES program when that customer receives a Low-
Income Home Energy Assistance Program grant.  This 
filing does not impact customer rates. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Corey Cook  +1 (360) 664-1309 
corey.cook@utc.wa.gov 

3. UE-250641 8/22/2025 

10/1/2025 
PacifiCorp 

Revises Tariff WN U-76, Schedule 98, Adjustment 
Associated with the Pacific Northwest Electric Power 
Planning and Conservation Act, adjusting the credit from 
0.791 cents per kWh to 1.217 cents per kWh for 
qualifying customers. This adjustment increases the 
rebate related to Residential Exchange Program benefits 
the Company receives from the Bonneville Power 
Administration. The monthly bill for an average residential 
customer using 1,200 kilowatt-hours will decrease $5.11, 
or 4.1 percent. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Sylvana Sorrells  +1 (360) 664-1273 
sylvana.sorrells@utc.wa.gov 

4. UE-250648 8/27/2025 

10/1/2025 
Puget Sound Energy 

Revises Tariff WN U-60, Schedule 129, Low Income 
Program, establishing a Cap for Total Benefits available 
to customers for the 2025-2026 Low Income Program 
year and final adjustments for 2022-2023 write-off 
balances along with other program 
funding adjustments increasing company revenues by 
$41.059 million. The monthly bill for an average 
residential customer using 800 kWh per month will 
decrease $1.18, or 0.87 percent. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Corey Cook  +1 (360) 664-1309 
corey.cook@utc.wa.gov 

mailto:corey.cook@utc.wa.gov
mailto:sylvana.sorrells@utc.wa.gov
mailto:corey.cook@utc.wa.gov
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5. UG-250649 8/27/2025 

10/1/2025 
Puget Sound Energy 

Revises Tariff WN U-2, Schedule 129, Low Income 
Program, establishing a Cap for Total Benefits available 
to customers for the 2025-2026 Low Income Program 
year and final adjustments for 2022-2023 write-off 
balances along with other program funding 
adjustments  increasing company revenues by $19.377 
million. The monthly bill for an average residential 
customer using 64 therms per month will see a decrease 
of $1.38, or 1.35 percent. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Corey Cook  +1 (360) 664-1309 
corey.cook@utc.wa.gov 

6. UE-250664 8/29/2025 

10/1/2025 
Puget Sound Energy 

Revises Tariff WN U-60, Schedule 194, Residential and 
Farm Energy Exchange Benefit, adjusting the credit from 
0.7534 cents per kWh to 0.6648 per kWh for qualifying 
customers. This adjustment decreases the rebate related 
to Residential Exchange Program benefits the Company 
receives from the Bonneville Power Administration. The 
monthly bill for an average residential customer using 
1,200 kilowatt-hours will increase $0.71, or 0.52 percent. 

Tariff Revision 

Staff Contact: Sylvana Sorrells  +1 (360) 664-1273 
sylvana.sorrells@utc.wa.gov 
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