Carlson, Joni (UTC)

From: Hunter, Kathy (UTC)

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2008 9:59 AM

To: UTC DL Records Center

Subject: FW: Could you tell me if this penalty of $100 has been paid....

Records Center,
Please print this e-mail and include it in TE-060824 and close this docket.

Thanks — Kathy

From: Sedillo, Brandy (UTC)
Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2008 9:50 AM

To: Hunter, Kathy (UTC)

Subject: RE: Could you tell me if this penalty of $100 has been paid....

Yes it has.

From: Hunter, Kathy (UTC)

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2008 9:43 AM

To: Sedillo, Brandy (UTC)

Cc: Young, Mike (UTC)

Subject: Could you tell me if this penalty of $100 has been paid...

TE-060824 — Thomas J. and Linda Cook dba Silver City Charters?

Thanks - Kathy




