WUTC DOCKET: UE-190529¢tal.
EXHIBIT:BGM-6
ADMITE@ W/DO REJECTO Exhibit BGM-6

Dockets UE-190529/UG-190530/UE-190274/UG-190275
Witness: Bradley G. Mullins

BEFORE THE
WASHINGTON UTILITIES AND TRANSPORTATION COMMISSION

WASHINGTON UTILITIES AND

TRANSPORTATION COMMISSION, DOCKETS UE-190529 and

UG-190530 (consolidated)
Complainant,

V.

PUGET SOUND ENERGY,

Respondent.

In the Matter of the Petition of
PUGET SOUND ENERGY DOCKETS UE-190274 and
UG-190275 (consolidated)
For an Order Authorizing Deferral
Accounting and Ratemaking Treatment
for Short-life UT/Technology Investment.

N N N N N e e N N N N’ N N e e e e e

EXHIBIT BGM-6
TCJA NORMALIZATION REQUIREMENTS


pdoyle215
Exhibit


Exh. BGM-6
Page 1 of 2

PUBLIC LAW 115-97—DEC. 22, 2017 131 STAT. 2099

(1) IN GENERAL.—Except as otherwise provided in this sub-
section, the amendments made by subsections (a) and (b) shall
apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2017.

(2) WITHHOLDING.—The amendments made by subsection
(b)(3) shall apply to distributions made after December 31,
2017.

(3) CERTAIN TRANSFERS.—The amendments made by sub-
section (b)(6) shall apply to transfers made after December
31, 2017.

(d) NORMALIZATION REQUIREMENTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—A normalization method of accounting
shall not be treated as being used with respect to any public
utility property for purposes of section 167 or 168 of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 if the taxpayer, in computing its cost
of service for ratemaking purposes and reflecting operating
results in its regulated books of account, reduces the excess
tax reserve more rapidly or to a greater extent than such
reserve would be reduced under the average rate assumption
method.

(2) ALTERNATIVE METHOD FOR CERTAIN TAXPAYERS.—If, as
of the first day of the taxable year that includes the date
of enactment of this Act—

(A) the taxpayer was required by a regulatory agency
to compute depreciation for public utility property on the
basis of an average life or composite rate method, and

(B) the taxpayer’s books and underlying records did
not contain the vintage account data necessary to apply
the average rate assumption method,

the taxpayer will be treated as using a normalization method
of accounting if, with respect to such jurisdiction, the taxpayer
uses the alternative method for public utility property that
is subject to the regulatory authority of that jurisdiction.

(3) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this subsection—

(A) EXCESS TAX RESERVE.—The term “excess tax
reserve” means the excess of—

(i) the reserve for deferred taxes (as described in
section 168(1)(9)(A)(ii) of the Internal Revenue Code
of 1986) as of the day before the corporate rate reduc-
tions provided in the amendments made by this section
take effect, over

(ii)) the amount which would be the balance in
such reserve if the amount of such reserve were deter-
mined by assuming that the corporate rate reductions
provided in this Act were in effect for all prior periods.
(B) AVERAGE RATE ASSUMPTION METHOD.—The average

rate assumption method is the method under which the
excess in the reserve for deferred taxes is reduced over
the remaining lives of the property as used in its regulated
books of account which gave rise to the reserve for deferred
taxes. Under such method, during the time period in which
the timing differences for the property reverse, the amount
of the adjustment to the reserve for the deferred taxes
is calculated by multiplying—

(i) the ratio of the aggregate deferred taxes for
the property to the aggregate timing differences for
the property as of the beginning of the period in ques-
tion, by

26 USC 168 note.



Exh. BGM-6
Page 2 of 2

131 STAT. 2100 PUBLIC LAW 115-97—DEC. 22, 2017

(ii) the amount of the timing differences which
reverse during such period.

(C) ALTERNATIVE METHOD.—The “alternative method”
is the method in which the taxpayer—

(i) computes the excess tax reserve on all public
utility property included in the plant account on the
basis of the weighted average life or composite rate
uszd to compute depreciation for regulatory purposes,
an

(ii) reduces the excess tax reserve ratably over
the remaining regulatory life of the property.

(4) TAX INCREASED FOR NORMALIZATION VIOLATION.—If, for
any taxable year ending after the date of the enactment of
this Act, the taxpayer does not use a normalization method
of accounting for the corporate rate reductions provided in
the amendments made by this section—

(A) the taxpayer’s tax for the taxable year shall be
increased by the amount by which it reduces its excess
tax reserve more rapidly than permitted under a normaliza-
tion method of accounting, and

(B) such taxpayer shall not be treated as using a
normalization method of accounting for purposes of sub-
sections (f)(2) and (i)(9)(C) of section 168 of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986.

SEC. 13002. REDUCTION IN DIVIDEND RECEIVED DEDUCTIONS TO
REFLECT LOWER CORPORATE INCOME TAX RATES.

(a) DIVIDENDS RECEIVED BY CORPORATIONS.—
26 USC 243. (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 243(a)(1) is amended by striking
“70 percent” and inserting “50 percent”.
(2) DIVIDENDS FROM 20-PERCENT OWNED CORPORATIONS.—
Section 243(c)(1) is amended—
1 (A) by striking “80 percent” and inserting “65 percent”,
an
(B) by striking “70 percent” and inserting “50 percent”.
(3) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—The heading for section
243(c) is amended by striking “RETENTION OF 80-PERCENT DIvI-
DEND RECEIVED DEDUCTION” and inserting “INCREASED

PERCENTAGE”.
(b) D1vIDENDS RECEIVED FrROM FSC.—Section 245(c)(1)(B) is
amended—
d(1) by striking “70 percent” and inserting “50 percent”,
an

(2) by striking “80 percent” and inserting “65 percent”.
(¢c) LIMITATION ON AGGREGATE AMOUNT OF DEDUCTIONS.—Sec-
tion 246(b)(3) is amended—
(1) by striking “80 percent” in subparagraph (A) and
inserting “65 percent”, and
(2) by striking “70 percent” in subparagraph (B) and
inserting “50 percent”.
(d) REDUCTION IN DEDUCTION WHERE PORTFOLIO STOCK IS
DEBT-FINANCED.—Section 246A(a)(1) is amended—
d(1) by striking “70 percent” and inserting “50 percent”,
an
(2) by striking “80 percent” and inserting “65 percent”.
(e) INCOME FrROM SOURCES WITHIN THE UNITED STATES.—Sec-
tion 861(a)(2) is amended—





