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 August 13, 2010  
 
This list of permanent operating authority applications pending and temporary operating 
authority applications granted is issued under the provisions of Title 81 and WAC 480 of the 
Commission’s Laws and Rules.  
 

PERMANENT Solid Waste Carrier Authority Application Pending 
 
As provided in WAC Solid Waste Carrier application filings are subject to protest for 30 days 
from the date they appear on this docket.  Protests must be filed according to the provisions of 
rule and must set out the specific grounds for opposing the application and must contain a 
concise statement of the protestant’s interest in the proceeding. 
 
Application Date Filed Applicant & Service Desired  
 
Docket No. 
TG-101354 

 
08/12/10 

 
Sanitary Service Company, 
Inc. 
P O Box 1702 
Bellingham  WA  98227 
 

 
Blaine-Bay Refuse, Inc. 
4916 La Bounty Place 
Ferndale  WA  98248 
 

 
Application for authority to transfer all rights under certificate G-145, standing in the name of 
Blaine-Bay Refuse, Inc., to G-14, standing in the name of Sanitary Service Company, Inc.  The 
authority to be transferred is as follows: 
 
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICE In the City of Blaine, Washington, and within a radius 
of one mile of said city limits in Whatcom County and in that portion of Whatcom County 
described as follows: Starting at the intersection of Blaine Road and Dakota Creek; thence 
south on Blaine Road to its intersection with Grandview Road; thence west on Grandview Road 
extended to the shoreline of Georgia Strait; thence northerly following the shoreline of Georgia 
Strait, Birch Bay, Semiahmoo Bay, and Drayton Harbor to its intersection with the centerline of 
Dakota Creek; thence easterly along the centerline of said creek to its intersection with Blaine 
Road, the point of beginning. 
 
NOTE:  This carrier currently holds the following authority: 
 
(PID 482) SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICE In that portion of Whatcom County 
described as follows:  beginning at the northeast corner of Section 32, T. 41 N., R. 1 E.; thence 
south on Harvey Road projected to Interstate 5; thence southeasterly on Interstate 5 to Birch-
Bay-Lynden Road; thence east on Birch-Bay-Lynden Road to Bay-Lyn Drive; thence south and 
east on Bay-Lyn Drive to Guide Meridian; thence north on Guide Meridian to the Birch-Bay-
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Lynden Road/Kok Road intersection; thence east on Kok Road projected to the Hannegan 
Road/Polinder Road intersection; thence south on Hannegan Road to Hemmi Road; thence 
east on Hemmi Road, Fazon Road, Goshen Road and Cedarville Road to SR-542; thence 
easterly and northerly on SR-542 to Kendall Road; thence northerly and westerly on Kendall 
Road to Reese Hill Road, thence westerly and northerly on Reese Hill Road to Hillview Road; 
thence easterly and northerly on Hillview Road to Nims Road; thence north on Nims Road 
projected to the Canadian boundary; thence east on the Canadian boundary to the 
Whatcom/Okanogan county line; thence south on said county line to the south line of Section 3, 
T. 40 N., R. 16 E.; thence west along said south line extended to the northeast corner of Section 
5, T. 40 N., R. 10 E.; thence south along the east line of said section extended to the southeast 
corner of Section 17, T. 39 N., R. 10 E.; thence west along the south line of said section 
extended to the northeast corner of Section 21, T. 39 N., R. 9 E.; thence south along the east 
line of said section extended to the southeast corner of Sec. 28, T. 39 N., R. 9 E.; thence west 
along the south line of said section extended to the northeast corner of Section 35, T. 39 N., R. 
8 E.; thence south along the east line of said section extended to the Whatcom-Skagit County 
line (also the southeast corner of Section 35, T. 37 N., R. 8 E.); thence west along said county 
line to its intersection with the Whatcom-San Juan County line; thence northerly along said 
county line to its intersection with the US/Canada boundary (also with the west line of T. 39 N., 
R. 2 W.); thence northerly along said boundary line to the north line of T. 41 N.; thence east on 
said township line to the northwest corner of  T. 41 N., R. 3 W.; thence south on the west line of 
said township to the southwest corner of the north half of T. 40 N., R. 3 W.; thence east on the 
south line of the north half of said township to the east line of said township; thence north on the 
east line of said township extended to the US/Canada boundary (also the north line of T. 41 N., 
R. 3 W.); thence east along said boundary to N. E. corner of Section 32, T. 41 N., R. 1 E., the 
point of beginning..  
  
(PID 483) EXCLUDING the City of Blaine, Washington, and within a radius of one mile of said 
city limits (dated January 31, 1968, MVG 340). 
 
NOTE:  PID reference numbers are for Washington Utilities and Transportation Commission 
internal GIS mapping purposes only. 
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