Leieski, Tina (UTC)

From: Stillwell, Suzanne (UTC)

Sent: Friday, May 02, 2014 1:40 PM
To: Leipski, Tina (UTC)

Cc: Dotson, Michael (UTC)
Subject: FW: Ivan G Anton

Tina, can you process this refund. Thanks, Suzanne

From: Ivan .A [mailto:LinicerEternity@yahoo.com)
Sent: Friday, May 02, 2014 11:08 AM

To: UTC DL Transportation

Subject: lvan G Anton

hello, i'm lvan anton, and i applied for cc# to work for Express North America couriers, and obviosly nothing worked
between us, so i'd like the full refund back into my bank account, the amount of $275.00 thank you.



