+STATE OF WASHINGTON

A 19-2A VOUCHER DISTRIBUTION
(REV. 1/91)
VENDOR NAME AND ADDRESS AGENCY NUMBER LOCATION CODE

- 2150

Excalibur Limousine LLC
AGENCY P.R. OR AUTHOQRIZATION NUMBER

15810 74th Ave. NE REFUND

Kenmore WA 98028

AGENCY NAME AND LOCATION

UTILITIES AND TRANSP, COMM,
1300 S. EVERGREEN PK DRIVE S.W.
P.0O. BOX 47250

OLYMPIA, WA 98504-7250

FEDERAL |.D. NO. OR SOCIAL SECURITY NO. {FOR REPORTING PERSONAL SERVICES CONTRACT PAYMENTS TO 1.R.S.} RECEIVED BY DATE RECEIVED

BUSINESS OFFICE

USE SPACE BELOW AS A WORKSHEET TO DEVELOP OR EXPLAIN THE GOODS OR SERVICES PURCHASED STAPLE INVOICES ON BACK

REVENUE REFUND - Carrier withdrew application to add on a trade name.

RECEPTION OR FIELD RECEIPT NO. 31117 DATED 3/8/11 $35.00

PREPARED TELEPHONE NUMBER DATE AGEN A;fHOVAL - DATE
Ting Leipski 664-1170 4127111 7N 5 -2/
N /
paoc. DATE\"———/ PMT DUE DATE CURRENT DOC. NO. REF. DOC. NO. VENDOR NUMBER VENDOR MESSAGE USE TAX uBt NUMBER
VOD1
REF ™M MASTER\NDEX SuB - WORK COUNTY CiTY/
boc TRANS o] APPN PROGRAM SuU SuB ORG CLASS TOWN SUB PROJ INVOICE
SUF CODE D FUND INDEX INDEX B OBJECT INDEX ALLOC BUDGET MOS PROJEC PRCJ PHAS AMOUNT NUMBER
oBJ UNIT T
: $35.00

198 111 02 68 | REFUND

ACCOUNTING APPROVAL FOR PAYMENT DATE WARRANT WARRANT
TOTAL $35.00 NUMBER




S

CUE-IOYYY - AN

. ‘1300 S. Evergreen Park Dr. SW
B ‘ - ' P.Q. Box 47250

UTILITIES AND TRANSPORTATION
COMMISSION

Olympia, WA 98504-7250
Phone: 360-664-1222
Fax: 360-586-1181

TTY: 3680-586-8203

or

1-800-416-5289
e-mait: Transportation@utc.wa.gav

APPLICATION FOR CHARTER AND EXCURSION CARRIER SERVICE
CERTIFICATE

Application Fee and Initial Regulatory Fees due at time of application:
$200 PLUS $25 PER VEHICLE__

Passenger Charter and Excursion Carrier Services Fee Required

Application fee - $200.60

(Application for new certificate, to reinstate a previously canceled certificate, to transfer
an existing certificate to a new owner or business structure)

Name Change _g W Cd/y oV 717{&

{Application to change3d company’s corporate name, change a trade name, add a new tkade name,
or change the surname of an m.dmdual owner or partner)

Regulatory Fee (}ier vehicle) : @\ < ( S 25. h

TYPE OF PAYMENT

- o Cash o Check o Money Order 2 AMEX %Master(:ard O Visa

_ : Exp Date
Credit Card Information (if applicable) 7 ?% @?ﬂg (‘7 7 Month/Y ear

| Amount $ 2@ S.00 Company Name: EXe A \Boa sy Ll Ao b

CERTIFICATION: I, the undersigned, under penalty for false staternent, certify that the following
information is true and correct, that I am authorized to execute and file this document on behalf of the
applicant, and that all information on file 1s current and valid.

Cardholder’s signature: C /Q’/ C’_& Date: 2 -3 L
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Leipski, Tina (UTC)

From: Kevin Williams <kevin@seattlegreenlimo.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2011 10:02 AM

To: Leipski, Tina (UTC)

Subject: . Re: Use of UTC Permitted Charter Name on Non-Regulated Vehicie's
Tina,

[ don't want to transfer or change names. Just add the two vehicles to the existing certificate, as is.

Thanks,

Kevin Williams v
kevin@seattlegreenlimo.com
Phone: 206-407-3656

Txt: 206-510-5090

Saving the world one french fry at a time...

----- Original Message -----

From: Leipski, Tina (UTC)

To: Kevin Williams

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2011 9:48 AM

Subject: RE: Use of UTC Permitted Charter Name on Non-Regulated Vehicle's

Kevin,

I'm still waiting on clarification for Excalibur Limousine LLC's ownership from you. If it entails a transfer, then you must
submit a transfer application.

The trade name of “Carbon Tread” still isn't registered with the Department of Licensing.
Let me know what is happening at this point. Thanks!

Tina

From: Kevin Williams [mailto:kevin@seattlegreenlimo.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2011 8:38 AM

To: Leipski, Tina (UTC)

Subject: Re: Use of UTC Permitted Charter Name on Non-Regulated Vehicle's

Tina,
I've completed the UCR progam. Any word on the application process?

Thanks,

Kevin Williams
kevin(@seattlegreenlimo.com
Phone: 206-407-3656

Txt: 206-510-5090

Saving the world one french fry at a time...
| - Original Message -



