	"Herta Ingram" <hingram@thurstonpud.com> 

03/30/2005 03:41 PM
	


To

<geckhard@wutc.wa.gov>

cc

Subject

FW: Payoff for American Water Resources (Term Note)

	


	


Gene,

Pursuant to our conversation earlier, please prepare a memo for Virgil/Julie/Venture Bank indicating the WUTC’s concurrence with transferring the balances from the Facilities Charge Fund and the Surcharge Reserve Accounts to the Surcharge Note to pay down the principal prior to closing the sale of American Water Resources, Inc., to Thurston PUD on Friday.  If you need additional clarification or information, please call asap.  We need to have this to Venture Bank tomorrow pm. Thank you so very much.

Herta

From: dberg@LandAm.com [mailto:dberg@LandAm.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2005 3:18 PM
To: MTRAXLER@venture-bank.com; hingram@thurstonpud.com; hpaul@thurstonpud.com; brower@mentorlaw.com; virgfox@tds.net; reneremund@vanderstoep.com
Cc: jmparker@localaccess.com; DCHERNISKE@venture-bank.com
Subject: RE: Payoff for American Water Resources (Term Note)
Importance: High

Thank you very much, Mary.  

Virg/Rene and Josh/Harry/Herta - Please work with Mary to provide whatever written instructions she needs and whatever documentation she  needs regarding UTC approval.  If the instructions need to go through me, please let me know tomorrow.  Doing so may cause some delay.  If it is possible and acceptable to Mary, perhaps you could deliver the instructions and documentation to her tomorrow or Thursday morning, with the trigger for the closure and application of the funds to the loan being a telephone call or e-mail from me.  

Virg/Julia - Can the transactions on the facilities account be completed and stopped today, so that Mary can get me a final balance tomorrow?

From: Mary Traxler [mailto:MTRAXLER@venture-bank.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2005 2:58 PM
To: dberg@LandAm.com
Cc: jmparker@localaccess.com; virgfox@tds.net; David Cherniske
Subject: RE: Payoff for American Water Resources (Term Note)

Deborah:

1) Venture Bank will require written instructions from Virgil Fox to close the checking accounts and apply funds to the loan.  We would like concurrence in writing from TPUD and that UTC has approved the transaction and payment of checking funds to loans.

2) Interest on Capital Improvement Account 4140424510 is at rate of 1.09%.  Closing balance on 4/1/05 will include interest through 3/31/05.  That amount will be $27,137.01.

3)The Facilities account is noninterest bearing.

4) Capital Improvement account balance given above is effective 4/1/05 provided there are no further transactions. The facilities account has transactions in process today.  We will need to provide a verified balance on this account tomorrow, 3/31/05.

5) Wire transfer is acceptable to Venture Bank.  

6) Please reference Loan #4190036471.  

Please call if you have any further questions.

Mary Traxler

V.P. Business Banking Manager

Venture Bank
