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Introduction 

 
 

This annual Triple-E Report is produced in fulfillment of Avista’s commitment to 
provide enhanced analysis and reporting to the External Energy Efficiency (aka Triple E) 
Board.  This report covers the results from January 1 through December 31st, 2006 
including costs, energy savings, cost-effectiveness and descriptive statistics, tariff rider 
balances, and any other applicable updates and disclosures. 
 
The intent of this report is to provide a useful management tool for the implementation as 
well as a summary for external review and basis of regulatory prudency of the 
Company’s energy efficiency programs. 
 
 
Cost/Benefit Recognition 

 
Key to providing useful management data is the matching of costs and benefits.  As part 
of this process, the Company has developed a classification process for non-residential 
site specific projects as they move through the pipeline.  The classification phases are 
scope, study, contracted, construction, and completed.  In addition, there are also phases 
for inactive and terminated for projects that have abandoned or are no longer progressing 
toward fruition.  These phases aid in identifying various stages of active management as 
well as projecting future project completions and cash flow impacts resulting from the 
payment of. 
 
This methodology is applied to all site-specific non-residential projects.  Since non-
residential prescriptive, residential and limited income projects are smaller in nature and 
have shorter, more consistent sales cycles, they are realized only upon completion. 
 
Due to the size of the individual projects and the amount of upfront time necessary to 
evaluate projects, the Company has developed a “derating” process whereby costs and 
benefits are symmetrically realized as a project moves through the pipeline.  For cost-
effective purposes, 75% of project is recognized when contracted, another 20% (95% in 
total) is realized when the project begins construction and the final 5% (100% in total) is 
realized when the project is completed and post-verified.  All associated costs/benefits 
such as projected energy savings, non-energy benefits and customer incremental cost are 
all realized based on this same schedule.    
 
Specific definitions have been developed around the three phases where there is 
recognition of cost/benefits to ensure consistency in the evaluation process and to provide 
a sound basis for future projections. 
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Utility Costs 
 
Utility costs for each customer segment can be allocated into categories of either 
incentives or implementation.  General utility costs have historically included costs that 
are difficult to accurately allocate to customer segments and programs.  Examples of 
general costs would be an expense that benefits all customer segments and several 
programs/technologies or non-specific training that do not clearly benefit a particular 
project or segment or that benefits many projects/segments.   
 
For purposes of calculating cost-effectiveness, general costs are allocated to 
implementation across customer segment and technology based on annual savings.  This 
is also necessary for evaluation of the distribution of resources within each segment, 
program and technology.  Eighty-one percent of electric utility costs, exclusive of 
regional expenditures, are allocated between HVAC, Lighting and Shell while 97% of the 
gas utility costs are allocated between HVAC and Shell.  As compared with 2005, utility 
costs have increased 59%, which equates to an 83% increase for electric and a 16% 
increase for gas.     
 
As shown in Table 1, general costs are almost 6% of the total utility costs and 26% of the 
utility non-incentive costs.  Nearly, 80% of expenditures were returned to ratepayers 
through incentives.  The percentage returned to ratepayers remains roughly the same 
when expenditures are segmented between electric and gas.   
 
Table 2 shows both direct and indirect (general) expenditures across customer segments 
for both electric and gas.  Table 3 shows the total utility costs across each customer 
segment and technology for both fuels.  Table 4 illustrates the distribution of direct 
incentives across customer segment as well as technology for both electric and gas. 
 
 
Incentives 
 
Table 4 illustrates electric and gas direct incentives returned to ratepayers.  For 2006, the 
total incentives paid by the Company were $8.9 million, an increase of 75% from 2005.  
Electric incentives increased 114% while gas incentives increased by 12%.  The bulk of 
the electric incentives were for HVAC and Lighting projects while the majority of the gas 
incentives were paid on HVAC and Shell projects.  Incentives demonstrated in Table 4 
are calculated on a cash basis but for cost-effectiveness purposes are derated in the same 
manner as other key variables. 
 
 
Program Savings 
 
During 2006, the Company contributed to projects incurring over 46 million kWh and 
almost 1.2 million therms.  For electric savings, 37% of the savings were achieved in 
Idaho and the remaining 63% were achieved in Washington.  For gas savings, 33% were 
achieved in Idaho and the remaining 67% were achieved in Washington.      
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Seventy-eight percent of the electric savings occurred in HVAC and Lighting while 97% 
of the gas savings occurred in HVAC and Shell.  Refer to Tables 5 and 6 for more detail 
on energy savings across customer segment and technology.  
 
The Company also participates in the Northwest Energy Efficiency Alliance (NEEA), 
however, the savings illustrated in this report exclude regional savings achieved through 
NEEA.  Participation in NEEA is included in the Company’s utility costs but is excluded 
for purposes of calculating cost-effectiveness.   
 
Energy savings calculations exclude estimates of free-riders, free drivers, and any market 
transformation effects.   
 
 
Non-Energy Benefits 
 
The non-energy benefits shown in Table 7 reflect the quantifiable non-energy benefits 
accruing to these energy efficiency projects.  Historically, quantifiable non-energy 
benefits have been limited to labor and/or maintenance savings associated with these 
projects.  Non-energy benefits are down 62% as compared with 2005.  Allocated by fuel, 
that is a decrease of 48% for electric and an increase of over tenfold. 
 
In addition to the quantifiable non-energy benefits, there are non-energy benefits 
associated with many projects that are difficult to quantify and therefore have been 
excluded from this report.   
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Customer Costs 
 
Customer costs are generally the bulk of the societal cost of energy efficiency measures 
and, for several reasons, are the most difficult to accurately track.  Energy efficiency 
upgrades are also implemented as part of larger facility improvements making it difficult 
to identify and value the incremental cost that is consistent with the claimed energy 
savings.   
 
For reporting purposes, the Company has historically emphasized that the baseline 
assumed for customer costs must be consistent with that used for the calculation of 
energy savings.  Customer costs are always reviewed in depth prior to cost-effectiveness 
and other analysis is performed. 
 
Customer costs are down 17% from 2005, when excluding a significant, non-recurring 
high customer cost projects that occurred in 2005.  When allocated by fuel, this equates 
to 51% decrease for electric customer costs and a 91% decrease for gas customer costs.   
Customer costs are shown by customer segment and technology in Table 8.   
 
  
Cost-Effectiveness 
 
The Total Resource Cost (TRC) ratio is 1.67 for electric and 0.94 for natural gas.  For 
purposes of this report, gas avoided costs from the last filed Integrated Resource Plan 
(IRP) were used, however, recent SENDOUT runs shows higher avoided costs.   The 
largest, and most uncontrollable, component of TRC calculation is customer cost.  For 
electric and gas, customer cost contributes 87% and 94%, respectively, of the cost.  The 
Company’s levelized TRC cost is 3.6 cents per kWh and 95 cents per therm.  Based on 
our weighted average measure lives for electric and gas, this compares to a levelized 
avoided cost of 4.7 cents per kWh and 73 cents per winter therm (97% of 2006 therms are 
winter therms).   
 
Despite the 0.94 TRC ratio for the Company’s natural gas efficiency programs in 2006 
we do contend that these programs have and are continuing to deliver cost-effective 
resources for our customer.  We believe that this is the case for two reasons; (1) 
impending revisions in the avoided cost and (2) conservatism in the treatment of non-
energy benefits.  The reasoning behind each of these contentions is outlined below: 
 

Impending Review of Avoided Costs: Avista has recently completed the 
fundamental re-evaluation of electric avoided costs for use in evaluating electric-
efficiency options.  This revision recognizes several components of value not 
previously incorporated into the Company’s avoided costs to include risk, 
emissions and capacity costs.  It is the Company’s intent to perform the same 
review of natural gas avoided costs.  This review is likely to result in 
incorporating a value for reduced risk of price volatility, reduced end-use 
emissions and reduced compressor fuel cost into the final avoided cost.  We are 
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confident that the 2006 natural gas portfolio would be TRC cost-effective when 
benchmarked against the revised avoided costs. 

 
Conservatism in Quantification of Non-Energy Benefits: It has been the Company’s 
policy to include within the cost-effectiveness evaluation only those non-energy benefits 
that can be quantified beyond reasonable doubt.  This excludes the non-energy benefits 
associated with increased productivity, comfort, asset value, increased retail sales and 
many other elements that are not easily amenable to quantification.  It is our subjective 
belief that the inclusion of reasonable values for these non-energy benefits would result 
in the natural gas programs being deemed TRC cost-effective. 
The Utility Cost Test (UCT) ratio is 2.65 for electric and 2.98 for natural gas.  The largest 
contributor to UCT cost is the incentive cost.  For cost-effectiveness purposes, electric 
and gas derated incentives contribute 72% and 77%, respectively, of the cost.  On a cash 
basis, this equates to almost 70% of utility expenditures being returned to customers in 
the form of direct incentives. 
 
The Participant Test benefit-to-cost ratio was 3.33 for electric and 1.91 for gas.  This test 
gives an indication of customer cost-effectiveness. 
 
As expected, the Non-Participant Test of 0.65 for electric and 0.51 for natural gas was not 
cost-effective.  As long as billing rates are greater than avoided costs, this benefit-cost 
ratio will always be less than 1.  See Tables 9-13 for more on the cost-effectiveness tests. 
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Energy Efficiency Tariff Rider Balance 
 
During 2006, the Company collected $7.1 million electric and $1.5 million natural gas 
tariff rider revenue.  Utility expenditures were $8.5 and $2.8 million for electric and 
natural gas respectively, spending $2.6 million more than was collected in revenue.  The 
aggregate tariff rider balance, as of the end of 2006, was negative $3.4 million which is 
an increase of $3 million from year end 2005.  See Table 14 for more detail by 
jurisdiction and fuel. 
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