Chiles, Pam (UTC) TE ~1O1%K ]

From: Stillwell, Suzanne (UTC)

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 8:34 AM

To: UTC DL Records Center

Cc: Pratt, David (UTC)

Subject: FW: Adding statement document for Permit re-instatement

Please add the following email to the record in docket TE-160187.

From: Stillwell, Suzanne (UTC)

Sent: Friday, May 13, 2016 1:57 PM .

To: sanimaurou@yahoo.com

Cc: Pratt, David (UTC)

Subject: FW: Adding statement document for Permit re-instatement

Mr. Maurou, in your attached statement you indicate that you have arranged to pay an extra $50 monthly payment
toward the $1,000 penalty owed to the commission. Per the recent order we will need written documentation of a
payment agreement with AllianceOne Receivables Management, Inc. to pay the $1,000 penalty owed to the
commission. Sincerely,

Suzanne Stillwell

Licensing Services Manager
360-664-1224
SStillwe@utc.wa.gov
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From: Sani Washington [mailto:sanimaurou@yahoo.com]

Sent: Friday, May 13, 2016 8:05 AM

To: UTC DL Records Center <records@utc.wa.gov>

Subject: Adding statement document for Permit re-instatement

Dear Madam/Miss/Sir,

Please to accept this adding document for my
permit re-instatement.



1 page attached.

Sincerely, yours.

SeaTac Airport 24
Sani Maurou
206-319-7076



