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~~~ 1300 South Evergreen Park Dnve SW
PO Box 47250

UTILITIES AND TRANSPORTATION Olympia, WA 98504-7250
COMMISSION Phnor(34U)(i(i4-1222 ,

Fax (360) 586-'1181
Web Site: www.wutc.wa.4ov

CHARTER AND EXCYJTZSlON 17EGULATORY FEE

Company Name ~r`,' ~ G; ~r~ rt G..y~„ G~,.~

Company Addcess ~~ ~o;~• y ~~ ~

Company City ~~ ~c ~ State ~ ~q Zip q ~~ O 1

Company Certificate NumberG~i'~- ~~~~0 Email addxess: 1~r,,;e a~ ~u'~►~;~s/;,,,o, cc;-y

In accordance with RCW 81.70.350 "Regulatory Fees", the Commission requires Ghart~r and
excursion companies to file reports of the number of vehicles operated by the company and pay
the sum of $25 for each vehiclz operated. There is a minimwn fee of $?5.

1. Total number of. vehicles operated

dotal Re~ulatary Fees owed (enter amount X 25.00 = $ ~,5
from link 1) ~~~a~coQ o~'ooc L~~,col.~ 7a~.un~ ~}•Fo on o•/ri~o~~.~P "~i~'~''

There is u mir~rmurr~ fee of $25.00

r~ Cash ❑Check ❑Money Order o AMEX ❑ MasterCard 'gY Visa
~xp pate

Credit Card Information (if appliouble) M,,,,rhiv~~~
.. ,~~

~- ~

Amo«nt $ . pZS, ~ _ ~a~(~

"' l

CERTIFICATYdN~:
t, the undersibned, under penalty for false staterr~ent, certify that the following information is crue
and correct, that I am authorized to execute and file this document on behalf of the applicant, and
that all information on file is current and valid.

NAM.0 (Printed):

SIGNATUR~~~~ ̀,~. ~~'~~-~~ ~ DATB:~ /~i~5' /i~5

Fur Cumi~ission U~~~ Unly

(~S'~2'~
Rcf. No.:

Z 5 • ~~ 001- I 11-02.68-0;2-05:

O Z, Z

ltc~ption Number:,

001-111-02-68-332-01

~~~
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(this schedule is mandatory for Charter & Excursion c~niers)

.. _..~
,; R

.
',:..: ~.: AS.S~N~*~eR'TRA,NSPp:R'fRiTION.VE'HIC.t,E:',LI.STI.N.G.~~`':. 

,.,,.,;:;','. ,. ::.... ,, ; : •.

. o

- - ..• _
• ~ ...,.

~~~~~ ~ 'I J _ J y ~~

~~~~ ~~

~~-~ ~~

o~~s ~~—.

~~r~ ~~~
~~~~ ~e~

~~~~ ~ ~~~
r—tea ■~n~~t
r~~~ ~~
~~s~ ~—
~~~~ r~—

~~~~ ~~
~o~~ ~r

~~~~■~■ ■■■mss~~~w■ ~aa
■■~~~~ ~~
~~~~ ~~
~~~~ ~~

'* 7 .. w~
'~' `, ' ~;~ ' 1 - r ~ _ = ° ' r .-1 « . u u.. ~r = ~n"~~ i - . ~„f l ,_ ~~ - u i'a},. F... ~-- I'`p 1. ____. ~ ~"-:'} 

:{.~..,-~
--

-Page 5-



Leipski, Tina (UTC)

From: melaniek.weber@gmail.com on behalf of Melanie Weber <melanie@tricitieslimo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 15, 2015 6:55 PM
To: Leipski, Tina (UTC)
Subject: Re: Charter and Excursion Regulatory Fee

Hi Tina,

The code on the back is 151. Could you do me a favor please and email me something showing the 3rd vehicle
has been added .onto our Charter with you guys?

Thanks,
Melanie

On Tuesday, December 15, 2015, Leipski, Tina (UTC) <tleipski(a~utc.wa. ov> wrote:

Hi Melanie,

I received a charter and excursion regulatory fee adding on a vehicle. Unfortunately, I need the CVV code
from the back of the card so that I can run it.

Sincerely,

Tina Leipski

Utilities &Transportation Commission

Licensing Services

360-664-1170

fax 360-586-1181

i


