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RE:  Inthe Matter of the Penalty Assessment Against Fiorito Enterprises, Inc., & Rabanco

Companies d/b/a Republic Services of Kent in the Amount of $1,000,
Docket TG-190089

TO ALL PARTIES:

On April 11, 2019, the Washington Utilities and Transportation Commission (Commission)
assessed a penalty of $1,000 (Penalty Assessment) against Fiorito Enterprises, Inc. & Rabanco
Companies d/b/a Republic Services of Kent for ten violations of Washington Administrative
Code 480-70-201. Page five of the Penalty Assessment consists of a form to be returned either
with payment, contesting the violation, or requesting mitigation. This form erroneously listed the
penalty owed as $800. This erratum notes and corrects that error by modifying the first option on
the form as follows:

Ve
L 1 1. Payment of penalty. I admit that the violations occurred and enclose $1,000 in
// ) payment of the penalty.

A corrected version of the form is attached to this Notice.

RAYNE PEARSON
Director, Administrative Law Division

Respect. Professionalism. Integrity. Accountability.
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PLEASE NOTE: You must complete and sign this document, and send it to the Commission
within 15 days after you receive the penalty assessment, Use additional paper if needed.

I have read and understand RCW 9A.72.020 (printed below), which states that making false
statements under oath is a class B felony. I am over the age of 18, am competent to testify to the
matters sct forth below and I have personal knowledge of those matters. 1 hereby make, under
oath, the following statements.

X] 1. Payment of penalty. I admit that the violations occurred and enclose $1,000 in
payment of the penalty.

[ ] 2. Contest the violations. I believe that some or all of the alleged violations did not occur
for the reasons I describe below (if you do not include reasons supporting your contest here,
your request will be denied):

[ ] a) Iask for a hearing to present evidence on the information I provide above to an
administrative law judge for a decision

OR [ ] b)Iask fora Commission decision based solely on the information I provide above.
[ ] 3. Application for mitigation. I admit the violations, but I believe that the penalty should

be reduced for the reasons set out below (if you do not include reasons supporting your
application here, your request will be denied):

[ ] a) Lask for a hearing to present evidence on the information I provide above to an
administrative law judge for a decision

OR [ ] b)Ilask for a Commission decision based solely on the information [ provide above.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of Washington that the foregoing,
including mfomml;on | have presented on any allachmulls is true and correct.
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Martinez, Sarah

From: Brown, Deborah
Sent: Friday, April 12, 2019 9:14 AM
To: Martinez, Sarah
Subject: FW: Confirmation of Payment

Good Morning,
This has been paid with my pcard for the amount of $1,000.00.
Please see below for confirmation number.

Thanks
Deborah

Deborah Brown

APSS

5075 E 74th Ave.
Commerce City, CO 80022

e DBrownd@republicservices.com

0 720-590-4232
w RepublicServices.com
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We'll handle it tfrom here

From: Official Payments - Customer Service <customerservice@officialpayments.com>

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2019 10:12 AM
To: Brown, Deborah <DBrown4@republicservices.com>
Subject: Confirmation of Payment

Note that (customerservice@officialpayments.com) is an external email. Report suspicious emails by clicking
on “Report Phishing", or forward to "infosec.phishing@republicservices.com"

Dear Official Payments Customer:

Thank you for selecting Official Payments Corporation for your electronic
payment to Utilities & Transportation Commission POS. Your payment of $1,000.00 was sent to
Washington Utilities & Transportation Commission on 04-12-2019. Your confirmation

number is 04102S.



To check the status of your payment, visit the Official Payments Corporation

web site at https://www.officialpayments.com/pc_paym.jsp. Please be prepared

to provide your e-mail address dbrown4@republicservices.com and one of the following two
items:

-Your confirmation number, 04102S

OR

-The last four digits of the card you used for payment, 7995

To become a registered user of Official Payments Corporation, enabling you to
access your complete tax and fee payment history, visit our Web site at
https://www.officialpayments.com/pc_sign.jsp.

Again, thank you for using Official Payments Corporation. We hope you enjoy
the convenience, cash management, and payment card benefits earned from your
payment.

Customer Service
Official Payments Corporation

Questions? Call toll-free 1-800-487-4567.
Did you know you can charge your state and federal income taxes? Visit

Official Payments Corp. at http://www.officialpayments.com for more
information.

For additional savings, please visit
http://www.officialpayments.com/SpecialOffers




