From: Brown, Sally (UTC)

Sent: Friday, September 26, 2008 11:22 AM
To: Hoyt, Sheri (UTC)

Cc: Wallace, Sharon (UTC)

Subject: RE: Permission to write-off

Permission granted.

Sally Brown

Senior AAG

UTC Division

(360) 664-1193

From: Hoyt, Sheri (UTC)

Sent: Friday, September 26, 2008 11:20 AM
To: Brown, Sally (UTC)

Cc: Wallace, Sharon (UTC)

Subject: Permission to write-off

Good morning Sally.

I’'m requesting permission to write-off the $100 penalty assessment issued on July 7, 2008, in docket UT-
081124 to Northwest Info Net, Inc. On September 9, 2008, the company requested to voluntarily cancel
its registration as it has ceased operating. The request was allowed to become effective yesterday,
September 25. As the company is no longer operating, it is unlikely it will remit payment for the penalty.

Thank you for your consideration,
Sheri



